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AOG Energy Returns in March – Reconnecting the Global Industry 
Returning to Perth 15-17 March 2023, the re-energised AOG Energy, will be a hub of 
collaboration as the entire supply chain comes together to discover opportunity and 
stimulate business growth.  
 
After the 2022 edition was cancelled due to border closures and COVID-19, AOG Energy 
returns to its former three-day glory with a full exhibition, conference program and sought-
after networking events. It’s the first-time international delegates have been able to attend 
since 2020.  
 
Operating for over 40-years, AOG Energy has a renewed focus on the energy transition so 
that it remains the industry platform to converge and showcase innovation. 

 

Exhibition 
The exhibition floor will host industry leaders, suppliers, and innovators, including major 
operators from the entire oil, gas, and energy sector. Exhibitors will showcase their 
capabilities and solutions across several specialised zones such as subsea, energy transition, 
drilling and completions, health and safety, digital technology, and more, as well as the 
wider energy portfolio. 

 

Conference 
Three dedicated conference theatres will return to the exhibition floor, free to attend. Each 
theatre will host industry led content that has been curated specially for AOG Energy.  
 
Key themes will include decarbonisation, low emission technology, hydrogen and new fuels, 
subsea technology, renewables, decommissioning, diversity and inclusion, talent, supply 
chain opportunities and so much more.  

 

Networking 
Known as the key industry platform to reconnect annually, the networking functions will be 
highly sought-after in 2023 as delegates return to Perth for the first time since 2021 – and 
for many since 2020.  
 
The Subsea Welcome Drinks, Official Opening Party and Diversity and Inclusion Breakfast 
will make up the formal networking events hosted by AOG Energy, as well as the endless 
opportunities to reconnect on the exhibition floor.  
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Get Involved  
With keen industry interest for the event to return, AOG Energy event organisers Diversified 
Communications Australia, look forward to welcoming back the community to celebrate and 
reconnect.  
 
Visitor registration will open late 2022, with stand bookings selling quickly.  
 
To join the mailing list and receive registration alters, subscribe to AOG Energy here.  
 
If you are interested in finding out more about exhibiting, contact the team here. 
 
 
--End ---  
For all media enquiries, please contact Demi Redenbach, Marketing Manager – AOG Energy. 
dredenbach@divcom.net.au  
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